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Studies in Documents 

The London District and Middlesex County, 
Ontario, Coroner's Inquests, 1831 -1 900 

by GUY ST-DENIS 

On 15 April, 1832, a meeting of between 600 and 800 loyalists was held at Vittoria, in 
Norfolk County, in order to counter increasing local reform sentiments.' To emphasize 
their support for the Crown, a cannon was powdered for a royal salute but, 
unfortunately for one Donald M. Ross, it seems that it was too well powdered. When he 
applied a match the cannon exploded, and, as well as causing other damage and injuries, 
killed him instantly.2 Early in the afternoon of a July day in 1853, John Nichol and his 
wife stood conversing with several others near the door of the Anglican church in 
Wardsville. Nearby, two young boys in a wagon discovered a gun and began playing 
with it. Shortly afterwards a shot rang out, and Mrs. Nichol fell to the ground mortally 
wounded with a bullet lodged in the back of her head.3 In May of 1864, William Sewell's 
wife watched her husband as he entered a privy on their Caradoc Township farm. A few 
moments later she heard strange gurgling and dripping sounds. When she opened the 
door to investigate, Sewell collapsed into her arms with blood gushing from his slit 
throat.4 Shortly after Samuel Jepson arrived at work in the morning of 12 June 1894, he 
was called back to his London home where he was greeted by the lifeless body of his 
seven-month-old baby boy. His three other young children stood crying in the company 
of his wife, whose only concern was that she had not been able to send them all to 
heaven.5 These four deaths, although widely separated in time, place, and circumstance, 
each possessed an unnatural or questionable element. As a result, each was subjected to 
an investigation known as a coroner's inquest. It was the responsibility of the coroner 
and his jury to determine, if possible, the true cause of death and who or what was 
responsible. Like most nineteenth-century court proceedings, coroner's inquests 
throughout the period of the London District and after 1850 its successor, Middlesex 
County, generally produced a sizeable amount of paper. And although not all of it has 
survived, what remains still offers an expansive source on the subject of death in what is 
now southwestern Ontario. 

To appreciate fully the documents of the coroner's inquests, and their research 
potential, an understanding of the coroner's office and the procedure by which these 
papers were generated is first necessary. The origins of the coroner's inquest evolved out 
of the duties of the coroner, who in early medieval England apparently assisted the 
sheriff in keeping the peace.6 In 1276, during the reign of Edward I, the coroner's 
primary duties were set down by statute, and they included investigations into slayings, 
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sudden deaths and woundings.7 Several hundred years later, England had become an 
empire and spread both its domain and system of justice to its possessions in North 
America. After the conquest of New France in 1759, the office of the coroner became 
one of many British judicial institutions introduced in the Province of Quebec, which 
was later divided into Upper and Lower Canada in 1 7 9 1 . ~ h u s ,  by the time the London 
District was proclaimed in 1800, the tradition of the coroner's office was already well- 
established within its boundaries.9 Upper Canadian coroners were appointed by the 
lieutenant-governor, usually on the recommendation of a local MLA or MP. The 
coroners, often medical doctors, were theoretically appointed for a term only as long as 
the monarch's pleasure, which in practice meant that they usually held the office for life. 
While there was no limitation on the number of appointments made, they were in part 
governed by the requirements of the locality, and "possibly in part by the energy shown 
by those seeking the office."'O 

Although coroners could be appointed to several jurisdictions within a specified 
district, or county in later years, their authority could not extend beyond these 
boundaries. This sometimes caused confusion and difficulty.ll One example is an 
incident that occurred between Middlesex and Elgin Counties. In June of 1884, the body 
of a baby was found floating in the Thames River near the now abandoned site of the 
former village of Cashmere, in Middlesex County's Mosa Township. Such incidents 
were not completely unheard of, as the Thames was used on occasion to dispose of the 
bodies of dead, usually unwanted, babies. The local Mosa coroner, however, refused to 
conduct an inquest because the corpse was found on the Elgin County side of the river, 
which made it a matter beyond his jurisdiction. Consequently, an Elgin County coroner 
from Rodney had to be notified, who then ordered a burial without an inquest! The 
citizens of Cashmere were not impressed, and not a little indignant.I2 

The purpose of the coroner's inquest was straightforward enough: to investigate the 
cause of death and assign responsibility. In this sense the inquest's findings also 
determined whether further investigation was in order. If an inquest found that a death 
had resulted from criminal intent, it became a case for prosecution in the criminal court. 
In most cases, however, death was assigned to natural causes, which not only closed the 
case but also limited the amount of documentation. Because coroner's inquests were 
courts of record, their proceedings resembled other higher level courts. I' Evidence was 
introduced, witnesses' testimonies were heard by twelve jurors, and a coroner presided 
who (like a judge) legally guided the investigation and received the verdict. lnquest 
proceedings were instituted upon notice of a questionable death, at which time the 
coroner would immediately empanel the jury. Potential jurors were to be local men who 
were honest, law-abiding, indifferent (meaning objective) and literate. These were the 
preferred qualifications, but, since they were not strict requirements, less qualified men 
might also be summoned. Witnesses, or anyone possessing information material to the 
investigation, were expected voluntarily to come forward and present their evidence. If a 
witness refused, the coroner had the authority to compel his attendance through a 
summons.14 

The inquest would then be opened on the appointed day in any conveniently located 
building. The first duty of the jury was to examine the corpse, which had to be available 
as its viewing was an indispensable part of the procedure. After taking particular note of 
the wounds on the deceased and any stains or marks on the clothing, the coroner and 
jury removed to the place where the body was discovered. There they examined the 



position in which the body was found, observed surrounding objects, and watched the 
bearing and conduct of those in attendance.I5 All these factors were noted in order to 
draw evidence as to the type of death suffered, and for indications of guilt. The jurors 
then retired, and the inquest continued with the evidence of the witnesses. Once these 
statements were finished, and if the body was not required for a post mortem, the 
coroner could direct its burial or disposal. Then, unless there was medical testimony to 
be heard, the jury deliberated on the cause of death and returned their verdict.16 

In earlier times, if the panel of twelve could not agree, they were kept without "meat, 
drink, or fire" until such time as they delivered their verdict. If this ordeal still did not 
help them reach a decision, they were adjourned until the next assize court met, when 
they could benefit from thejudge's opinion and direction." No evidence exists to suggest 
that these harsh measures were ever invoked in coroner's inquests held in the London 
District or Middlesex County, and later the approach employed to resolve the same type 
of impasse was improved in that jurors were allowed reasonable accommodation and 
refreshments. As in earlier times, if undecided, their deliberations were adjourned by the 
judge, who could then discharge them if necessary.ls The various crimes for which the 
jury might return a verdict were infanticide, suicide, murder, manslaughter, homicide by 
misfortune, and homicide in self-defence.19 Any one of these findings would move the 
coroner to apprehend the accused and prepare for the prosecution. This he did by 
submitting the inquisition, or written verdict, to the clerk of the peace of the district or, in 
later times, the crown attorney of the county.20 

Each inquest proceeding involved a certain amount of paperwork, which formed a 
class of legal documents. While there can be great variance in the number of papers 
located in each inquest file, there are three basic types which are usually found to be 
extant: the witnesses' information or depositions, the post mortem report, and the 
verdict. The witnesses' information are transcripts of verbal evidence presented to the 
jury, which were written down by the coroner during the inquest. These papers are 
accounts of the events leading up to the victim's death, and can be quite detailed and 
graphic. Frequently, several witnesses were called upon to give evidence, which in the 
end could cover many pages.2' In cases of multiple deaths, however, the inquest was 
often based on the investigation of one arbitrarily chosen victim, whose death was 
considered representative of the whole. This was generally the method employed when 
coroners were confronted with multiple fatalities arising from accidents such as train 
wrecks. Such inquests often concluded with the jurors making recommendations to 
prevent the same type of accident from occurring again. 

The post mortem was also known as a medico-legal (or doctor's) report on his 
examination of the corpse. These papers do not always appear in the coroner's inquest 
files, as doctors were not always called upon to prepare them. But if it appeared to the 
jury that such an examination was necessary to help determine the true cause of death, 
then a post mortem was arranged. A post mortem was often recommended in cases 
where there were no apparent signs of death associated with the body, or indications 
from the witnesses'information as to the probable cause of the fatality. The detail and 
sense of professionalism associated with the post mortems can vary considerably, 
particularly when early examples are compared with their later counterparts. On the 
whole, however, thepost mortems offer a medically precise opinion as to the cause of 
death, depending on the extent of medical knowledge at the time in question. Perhaps 
this explains why two post mortems are given in some cases.Z2 
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Figure I :  Although witnesses'information was recorded by the coroner, the witness had to attest the transcript 
with his or her signature. 



Figure 2: Thispost niorte~n into the death of Robert Millar is an example of the excruciating detail recorded in 
these documents. 
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Figure 3: The most important document was the inquisition. or the signed. written verdict of the jurors 
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Figure 4: By the mid-nineteenth century attempts wel-e made to standardi~e inquest documents through the 
introduction of legal forms. As this example indicates, their success was limited. 
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Figure 5: In 1894 legislation allowed coroners to waive inquests into deaths which they felt were obviously 
natural. This form was then filed in place of other inquest documents. 
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The last document produced during the inquest was the jury's written verdict. 
Formally referred to as the inquisition, this document recorded the jury's decision, and 
closed the inquest by either pronouncing the death natural, or by finding it criminal -in 
which case it became a matter for the criminal c0urt.~3 Inquisitions are found in almost 
every file, with the cause of death definitely stated (even when attributed to an act of 
God), and with the signatures and seals of the twelve jurors attached. 

The vague ancient mandate that inquests be performed on anyone "being slain or 
suddenly dead" left room for abuse in the form of superfluous and expensive inquests.24 
The lucrative fees associated with conducting a coroner's inquest may have benefited 
modern archivists and researchers with more records to consider, but the means by 
which this was achieved was distasteful in the extreme and remains so to this day. The 
problem of unnecessary inquests became so chronic that early coroners developed much 
the same reputation in their day as ambulance-chasers have in ours. That is to say, 
inquests were performed in situations where death had obviously resulted from natural 
causes, and where the coroner's services were not only unnecessary but obtrusive. 
Perhaps it is only fair to the early medical profession to note that doctors'fees were often 
low and sometimes unpaid. Yet some officious, or more likely unscrupulous, coroners 
were known to arrive at the victim's deathbed and watch "the advent of that which gives 
them jurisdiction with an avidity far from being creditable.'"5 It was important to 
conduct an inquest as soon after death as possible before decomposition altered the 
prime evidence provided by the corpse. Still, the insensitive practice of anticipating the 
victim's death greatly intensified the suffering of the deceased's famil~ .~6 

Worse still, from a cost perspective, was the burden exacted upon the district, and 
later county, treasury. As early as 1836, the expenses incurred by the districts through 
unnecessary inquests were questioned in the Upper Canadian House of A~sembly.~' 
And throughout the nineteenth century, there were numerous reforms to the statutes of 
the province governing the activities of coroners. Subsequently, a bill was passed by the 
Canadian Legislative Assembly in 1850, which the government hoped would reduce the 
number of unnecessary inquests. This was done by restricting inquests to those cases 
where it was apparent that death arose from violent or unfair means, culpable or 
negligent conduct, and not through mere accident or mischief.28 Although this 
legislation put a cap on unnecessary inquests, the number of inquests continued to 
mount in relation to the increase in population, and so did the amount of documentation 
associated with them. 

Dissatisfaction remained, giving rise to a series of unsuccessful proposals for 
amendments to the legislation. In 1855, the Kent County Council petitioned the 
Canadian Legislative Assembly to have the appointment of coroners vested in the 
county councils.29 In 1856, the same Council attempted to have the fees for medical 
testimony paid out of the Administration of Justice funds, rather than county 
treasuries.30 The Middlesex County Council tried a similar but equally unsuccessful 
approach eight years later.3' In 1857, the Legislative Assembly defeated a proposal that 
county coroners be elected by the county's land-owners, and in so doing upheld the 
lieutenant-governor's right to make such appointments.32 Two proposed, but 
unspecified, amendments for Perth County in 1862, and Brant County in 1863, were also 
in response to the high expenditures caused by the increasing number of inquests.33 The 
last such endeavour was undertaken by the Kent County Council, which in 1865 
requested that the number of coroners be restricted to one for each town or township.34 
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The counties were obviously trying to reduce costs by reducing the number of coroners 
who could perform inquests. It was not until 1879, however, that the problem was 
partially addressed by the government. Through an amending act, the financial 
obligations for city inquests were shifted from the counties to the cities; although this 
measure did not completely eliminate the expense of unnecessary inquests, it at least 
reduced the burden on the counties.35 

There were other legislative modifications affecting the finer points of the coroner's 
duties, but none altered the basic procedure of the inquest itself or the amount of 
documentation produced. At least, not until 1894. Legislation in that year allowed 
coroners to cancel inquests which they felt were not necessary. In these instances a 
typewritten form, with very limited information, was filed in place of the inquest.36 These 
documents record the apparent cause of natural death, and precluded the necessity for 
an inquest. Usually these deaths were obviously accidental. 

Although the London District was proclaimed in 1800, its coroner's inquest files date 
back only to 183 1." The post-1831 files are very incomplete, especially between 1836 and 
1842, where there is only one inquest, which dates from 1841. Beginning with 1845, the 
inquests appear to have survived fairly intact, but even so a number of files from later 
years appear to be missing. For example, only one file exists for 1857, none for 1888, and 
merely three for 1900. The reason for the large number of obviously missing early files is 
unknown. A plausible explanation, however, might be that very few inquests were taken 
during the initial, and sparsely populated, years of the London District. Also, many 
inquest papers may have been destroyed after submission to the district, either 
accidently or wilfully. Although the later Middlesex County series is not complete either, 
the number of files which have survived is much greater than those from the London 
District period. But considering the survival rate of coroner's inquests from adjacent 
southwestern Ontario counties, where they tend to be non-existent (with the exception 
of Huron County), Middlesex County has a very good representation. 

Incomplete as they are, the London District and Middlesex County coroner's inquests 
offer a potentially useful source to a wide range of researchers, including anyone 
interested in the history of the coroner's office - not to mention the related studies of 
pathology and criminology. Generally, the scope of the coroner's inquests might also 
touch upon other fields of historical study. Those interested in the social aspects of death 
in Upper Canada and early Ontario, for example, will find the voluminous amounts of 
witnesses' information invaluable in reconstructing past attitudes towards death in this 
province. Those genealogists who have transcended their statistical name and date 
pedigrees, and now look for the story behind their ancestors, will be rewarded if they are 
lucky enough to find a family member unlucky enough to have been the subject of a 
coroner's inquest.'* Unfortunately, the London and Middlesex coroner's inquests do 
not lend themselves to quantification because of their incompleteness, and the 
inconsistency of the information recorded. Finally, and d nothing else, the London 
District and Middlesex County coroner's inquests provide an interesting source of 
morbid reading material. Unfortunately, a problem encountered here is the difficulty in 
deciphering the handwriting of many coroner's inquests, which can be a frustrating 
drawback. This illegibility can probably be traced to the fact that most coroners were 
also medical doctors, who even in the nineteenth century had a poor reputation for 
penmanship. 



Formerly the property of the County of Middlesex, the London District and 
Middlesex County coroner's inquests now form part of the local history collection 
housed in the Regional Collection of The D.B. Weldon Library, University of Western 
Ontario. In 1973, members of the Church of Jesus Christ of Latter-Day Saints arranged 
the files chronologically for one of their microfilming projects. This, unfortunately, 
disrupted what remained of the original numbered sequence, which in any case was 
extremely sketchy. Their work was carried on by the late Madaline Roddick, who 
prepared the first index for genealogical purposes. Over the course of 1988, the author 
refined the Mormon organization and prepared a new index incorporating the following 
components: date of the inquest, place of the inquest and cause of death. 
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