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Introduction 

In 1927 Dominion legislation introduced a joint federal and provincial old age pen- 
sion programme to Canada. Ontario's participation began in 1929 under the direc- 
tion of a provincial commission within the Department of Labour. To qualify for 
the pension applicants had to meet a series of eligibility requirements, which 
included the means test (or evaluation of a person's pecuniary resources and ability 
to provide a livelihood). These requirements have since been condemned as a 
humiliation to aged citizens, a bureaucratic burden on municipal clerks (who dou- 
bled as local pension secretaries), and a discriminatory device used by government 
against those applicants deemed undeserving. Yet, from a research perspective, the 
restrictive nature of the programme did serve to generate large quantities of quan- 
tifiable data on the social and economic conditions of Ontario's elderly between 
1929 and 1948, data which are not normally contained in other government 
records. 

While the interpretation of this data is the domain of historians, archivists will be 
expected to provide the provenance for these and other welfare records, as interest 
in the field of social history continues to grow. Using the Norfolk Local Board as 
an example, this article will examine the administration of old age pensions during 
the programme's first twenty years; the type and scope of information recorded in 
the applications; and the current complications of access created by the Ontario 
Freedom of Information and Protection of Privacy Act. 

Towards a Pension Plan 

The movement towards old age assistance in Ontario coincided with the province's 
industrialization and urbanization during the latter part of the nineteenth century. 
Prior to that period, and despite the enlightened views of a few members of the 
Dominion parliament and the Canadian Trades and Labor Congress, the destitute 
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elderly were regarded to be the responsibility of their children. With little public 
demand for old age assistance, many of the elderly continued to work-only to be 
institutionalized when they were no longer able to support themselves. Depending 
on the facilities available and the physical or mental condition of the person in 
question, institutionalization could mean committal to the county poor house, a 
hospital, an insane asylum, or even the local county jail.' 

The question of old age assistance was first considered at the federal level in 
1906, when a Conservative member from Ontario gave notice of a resolution on 
the subject. Although the resolution was not debated, another attempt in the form 
of a motion soon f o l l o ~ e d . ~  In 1907 a select committee was established to inquire 
into a scheme; the Liberal Government, under Wilfrid Laurier, however, had 
already decided in favour of voluntary government annuities. The problem with 
annuities was that the holder had to contribute to the scheme over a long period of 
time in order to derive an income during retirement. Many people, however, could 
not afford to invest for their old age. While government annuities were offered for 
many years, therefore, they did not resolve the problem of destitution among the 
elderly .3 

The old age pension issue was not raised again until after the Conservative victo- 
ry in the election of 191 1. The new Conservative Government was no more deci- 
sive with respect to old age pensions than the Liberals had been, claiming that 
there was no public demand and that the funding of old age assistance was really 
the responsibility of provincial and local  government^.^ With 1914 and the begin- 
ning of the First World War, the question of old age pensions was set aside.5 In 
1915 the Trades and Labor Congress once again raised the issue, although with 
little effect until 1917 when the congress called for a Canadian labour party to 
represent the workers' interests. A number of Labour members were subsequently 
elected to both the provincial and Dominion parliaments-members who were in 
favour of the concept of old age pensions. 

The end of the war in 1918 caused severe economic re-adjustments on the work- 
force and coincided with a growing western dissatisfaction with central Canada's 
domination of the old political parties. The ensuing rise of western farmer and 
socialist parties was perceived ominously by commercial and industrial leaders as 
a Bolshevik threat against the political structure of Canada.h The Conservative gov- 
ernment responded by appointing the Mathers Commission to investigate the 
growing social unrest. After the Winnipeg General Strike of 1919, the commission 
expedited its investigation and soon recommended the consideration of a number 
of government welfare programmes to help reduce tensions. Old age pensions were 
among the commission's recommendations. 

Despite the 1921 Speech from the Throne, which announced that the Labour 
Department was looking into various old age pension systems, the Conservatives 
were unable to bolster their popularity in time for the federal election at the end of 
the year.' The succeeding Liberal Government also recognized the political neces- 
sity for old age pensions. The new Liberal Leader, W.L. Mackenzie King, initially 
showed little inclination to advance the interests of the elderly. In 1924, however, 
pressure from the Trades and Labor Congress, as well as from several provincial 
and federal legislators, forced King to establish a special parliamentary committee 
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on old age pensions. Provincial participation was an integral part of the resulting 
recommendation: unfortunately, provincial reluctance to share in the costs resulted 
in the scheme's deferment.x 

The October 1925 federal election left the Liberals seriously weakened, though 
King struggled on as prime minister for several months. Eager for much-needed 
outside support, King quickly negotiated with two Labour members when they 
sought provisions for the unemployed and aged in early 1926. Their timely 
approach helped the prime minister defeat a non-confidence motion against his 
government on 14 January. In reciprocation, King and his cabinet negotiated fur- 
ther with the Labour members and agreed on an old age pension bill. It was to be a 
non-contributory scheme for persons seventy years of age or older, universal, with 
funding provided by the federal and provincial levels of government on an equal 
basis.' The bill easily passed the House of Commons in March 1926, but then met 
with stiff resistance in the Conservative-dominated Senate. 

The main arguments used against the implementation of old age pensions centred 
around funding and the charge that they would intrude upon provincial rights. 
More particularly, the Conservative senators sensed a lack of public demand and 
ravaged the bill for what they saw as its potentially negative effects: the penaliza- 
tion of thrift, the removal of family responsibility and private charity, and the non- 
differentiation between the deserving and undeserving poor."' In the end, the bill 
was defeated. 

After King's resignation and a brief Conservative tenure in power, another elec- 
tion in September 1926 gave the Liberals a majority government." With his re- 
election, King made good on his promise to institute an old age pension plan. Early 
in 1927, a new bill was placed before the Commons, passed, and carried to the 
Senate. By that time most senators, including the Conservatives, interpreted the 
Liberal success at the polls as popular endorsement for old age pensions.I2 
Consequently, the bill was passed and received Royal Assent on 31 March 1927." 
In Ontario, the cost-conscious Conservative Government of Premier Howard 
Ferguson resisted joining the Dominion programme. However, public and legisla- 
tive pressure in favour of old age pensions finally resulted in Ontario's participa- 
tion, and this involvement was ultimately accomplished through the Ontario Old 
Age Pensions Act of 1929.14 

Implementation and Administration 

By the end of 1929 the Ontario Old Age Pensions Commission was fully estab- 
lished.I5 The Commission shared staff and office space in Toronto with the 
Mothers' Allowances Commission. (Although legally distinct organizations, both 
were administered within the Department of Labour.Ih) In order to conduct the pro- 
gramme at the municipal level, a network of local boards operated as subagencies. 
The local board first had to be satisfied that the applicant was eligible for a pen- 
sion. If the application was approved, it was then sent to Toronto where the Old 
Age Pension Commission had the power to sanction, modify, or disallow it." 

In the autumn of 1930 the Ontario Department of Public Welfare was created, 
with both the Mothers' Allowances and Old Age Pension commissions coming 



78 ARCHIVARIA 37 

under its jurisdiction.'%lthough the two continued to function separately, they 
shared a single chairman.I9 Under this new arrangement, the local old age pension 
boards (such as that for Norfolk County) operated with a high degree of discre- 
tionary authority-as they had previously. They not only answered queries about 
qualification requirements and assisted the elderly to apply, they were also expect- 
ed to investigate the validity of each application and advise if a pension should be 
granted." Many local boards were quite severe in their examinations. The scrutiny 
that they exercised can, in large measure, be explained by the fact that Ontario's 
municipalities were held responsible for twenty per cent of the provincial contribu- 
tion to the pr~gramme.~ '  The members of these boards consisted of five individuals 
appointed by the municipal council, who were often members of the council itself. 
Thus the financial interests of the municipality were well represented and 
protected.22 

Fraudulent applications were a constant source of concern in the early years of 
the programme, particularly during the lean years of the Great Depression. The fal- 
sification of birth records in order to meet the age requirement was seen as a partic- 
ular problem. Remaining alert to these threats against the public purse, the com- 
mission passed warnings on to the local boards by means of circulars, such as this 
one from about 1930: 

One [birth] Certificate we sent to the British Consul in Warsaw, Poland, 
telling him of our suspicions and asking him to have this compared with the 
official records and to secure a correct extract. The Certificate in question 
showed that the applicant was born in 1860 and when we got a reply from H. 
M. Consul it was found that the year of birth was "1867". In another case we 
were advised that the applicant, or some one on behalf of the applicant, had 
sent $10.00 to the priest in Poland to secure a false Certifi~ate.~' 

Abuse of the age requirement became chronic in cases where documentary evi- 
dence of birth did not exist and applicants were allowed to make a statutory decla- 
ration. As a result, in 1932 the commission ordered that: 

The declaration as to Age, by the applicant, will not be accepted by the 
Commission unless all other means of proving age have failed. As we have 
knowledge of so many cases where the applicants were not as old as they said 
they were, we are asking you to give us the date and place of the marriage, and 
the names of both contracting parties; or to obtain a birth certificate or regis- 
tration of baptism from their church; or give us the name of the township, 
county and post-office address where they resided in 1901. We will endeavour 
to obtain from the Census Department at Ottawa the age that they gave in that 
year.24 

To a generation not completely reconciled to the idea of social welfare, vigilance 
and the strict application of the means test were viewed as necessary safeguards 
against the potential abuse of society's benevolence. As the depression worsened, 
however, it was not uncommon for some local boards to become rather munificent. 
By October 1932, the number of old age pension recipients in Ontario had doubled 
from a predicted 21,000 to 41,658.25 It had become obvious that, despite the sub- 
agency organization, local pension boards were far from fair, efficient, or uniform 
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in their operations. Prejudice rather than objectivity usually shaped the board's 
decision about an applicant, often in violation of the regulations and guidelines of 
the programme. Consequently, also in 1932, local boards were relieved of their 
decision-making authority, relegating them to the position of merely advisory 
bodies.2h 

After the election of the Liberal Party in Ontario in 1934, an era of reduced 
provincial expenditures was introduced. Premier Mitchell Hepburn's government 
drastically reduced the services of the Department of Public Welfare, resulting in 
the abolition of the local pension boards altogether. They were replaced by munici- 
pal clerks, who assisted applicants and provided their opinion as to whether a pen- 
sion should be granted. The applications were then sent on to the commission in 
Toronto for approval.*' 

Because of high welfare costs brought on by the depression, most municipalities 
experienced increased difficulty in meeting their financial contributions to the 
province in support of old age pensions.28 Relief came in 1937 (which also hap- 
pened to be an election year for the Hepburn government), when Ontario assumed 
the full cost of the provincial share.'' At the same time, the formerly separate Old 
Age Pensions and Mothers' Allowances Commissions were amalgamated. 
Although Hepburn was bent on saving money through centralization, he bowed to 
pressure from the Dominion Government to reinstate local investigation of pension 
applications."' The result was that local pension boards were re-established on an 
unpaid basis, while a larger force of pension investigators was hired to replace 
those who were summarily fired in 1934. Throughout this period of reorganization, 
municipal clerks continued to process applications." 

The new Norfolk Local Board (which included Simcoe) did not enjoy the discre- 
tionary autonomy of its antecedent. Nor was it distinct, since the amalgamation of 
the Old Age Pensions and Mothers' Allowances Commissions meant that the 
Norfolk Pensions and Mothers' Allowances local boards were also united.'* Once 
again the authority of the new local pension boards was limited to advisory 
duties.13 Under this new arrangement 

people seeking aid went first to the local municipal offices where the clerk 
helped to fill out the application. This was sent to the office of the closest local 
board; the board gave it to a departmental investigator who made a visit to the 
applicant's home to verify details of eligibility. The papers came back to the 
local board which then formulated a recommendation to grant or not to grant 
the allowance. This was sent to the departmental commission in Toronto 
which made a final judgement and informed the applicant, local board and 
investigator. The interposition of a board composed of citizens, unpaid and 
outside administrative direction, was cumbersome. From the time of the first 
move by the applicant until he received a decision, up to seven months might 
elapse though three months was average.34 

While this bureaucratic system functioned adequately enough, World War I1 ulti- 
mately strained the programme's operations. Large numbers of senior civilians 
returned to the workforce during the latter half of the war, thereby reducing the 
caseload of old age pensioners; most of these people, however, retired after victory 
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was achieved in 1945. The result was a rush of applications. Under the 
Conservative Government of George Drew, which had come to power in Ontario 
in 1943, the problem was resolved by increased civil servant appointments-and 
particularly by an increase in the number of field  worker^.'^ 

The man responsible for implementing this extension of services was William 
Goodfellow, the Minister of the Department of Public Welfare. Goodfellow began 
a series of reforms, among which was the termination of municipal involvement in 
1948.36 He also planned to replace the Old Age Pensions and Mothers' Allowances 
boards with welfare units "based on consistent policy and legal it^."^' Goodfellow's 
vision was to make old age pensions more efficient by combining municipal and 
provincial operations under one organization, the local welfare unit. Unfortunately, 
problems involving municipal participation caused the plan's failure. The system 
that evolved in its place resulted in the establishment of provincial Public Welfare 
Department offices across Ontario, which further rendered municipal involvement 
unnece~sa ry .~~  

Before the end of municipal involvement, however, a change occurred in the old 
age pension programme which had an important effect upon applicants. In 1947 an 
amending act moved old age pensions toward universality by dropping the follow- 
ing eligibility requirements: 

the exclusion of aliens; the provision relating to the transfer to the pension 
authority of the pensioner's interest in his home; and the requirement of resi- 
dence in the province where application was made for at least five years 
immediately preceding commencement of benefits. The requirement of resi- 
dence in Canada for twenty years immediately preceding commencement of 
benefits was relaxed to permit the applicant to offset nonresidence during 
those years by prior residence equal to at least twice the period of nonresi- 
d e n ~ e . ~ '  

In 1951, the Old Age Pension Act of 1927 was replaced by the Old Age Security 
and Old Age Assistance acts. In the case of the Old Age Security plan, the federal 
government administered and financed universally-paid pensions. The means test 
was removed for individuals who were seventy years of age or older and had lived 
in Canada for twenty years.40 The other plan, that of Old Age Assistance, was cost- 
shared with the federal government and administered by the province on a means 
test basis for seniors between 65 and 69 years of age.4' 

In 1965 the Canada Pension Plan, a contributory plan, was added to the Old Age 
Security and Old Age Assistance programmes, providing retirement, disability, and 
survivors' pensions, as well as a lump-sum death benefit, within one social insur- 
ance package.42 Eventually, the Canada Pension Plan replaced Old Age Assistance, 
which was phased out  in 1969. Since then, Canadians have enjoyed the 
universally-paid Old Age Security pension at age sixty-five, which is further 
supplemented by previous earnings and contributions to the Canada Pension Plan.43 

The Application, 1929-1948 

Before senior citizens in Ontario could qualify for an old age pension, they first 
had to show that they were: 
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British subjects 

seventy years of age or older 

residents of Canada for twenty years 

residents of Ontario for five years 

not Indian as defined by the Indiatz Acl 

not receiving income more than $365 a year 

not ineligible through the transfer of property.44 

To meet these requirements the applicant had to submit an extensive amount of 
personal information, some of which was in reference to extremely blunt ques- 
tions: 

Are you now married, single, widow, widower, or divorced? 

If married, is your husband (or wife) living with you? 

If not, are you living apart pursuant to decree, order, or deed of separation? 

Is your husband (or'wife) an Old Age Pensioner? 

If not, why is he or she not an Old Age Pensioner? 

Are you an inmate of a house of Refuge or other institution? 

If so 

(a) Does any one contribute towards your maintenance? 

(b) How much? 

(c) Have you at any time transferred to the institution any property or money? 

(d) How much money or value of p r~per ty?~"  

At a time when lengthy government forms were still relatively unknown to the 
general public, the old age pension application was truly an intimidating docu- 
ment-even though local clerks assisted in filling it out. Apart from occasional for- 
mat changes of a minor nature over the years, the pension application remained 
basically the same as that first introduced in 1929. So, too, did the information 
required of elderly applicants. 

Nationality and Age 

Few if any applicants encountered difficulty with the nationality requirement, 
which recognized Canadians as being British subjects first and foremost. Most 
applicants were eligible by birth: those who were British by marriage or natural- 
ization usually had the documentation to prove their citizenship. A greater problem 
was proving the age requirement. In order to meet the minimum age of seventy 
years, applicants in 1929 had to have been born in 1859 or earlier. Unfortunately, 
civil registration in Ontario did not begin until 1 869.4h Therefore, the earliest appli- 
cants had to find other sources of documentation to prove their age, such as a bap- 
tismal record or some other church record, a marriage certificate showing age, a 
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birth entry in a family Bible, or, in some cases, census records4' If all else failed, 
the applicant was forced to collect affidavits from long-time acquaintances attest- 
ing to his or her declaration of age-which the commission could then choose to 
accept or reject. Of course, the inability to produce a birth record could also cast 
doubt on the applicant's citizenship. 

Residency 

Prior to making application for a pension, applicants were required to have resided 
in Canada for twenty years and in Ontario for five years. As the following old age 
pension regulations indicate, determining even the most basic residence qualifica- 
tion involved a rather complicated calculation. 

An applicant shall, in the absence of evidence to rebut such presumption, be 
presumed to have been resident in Canada for twenty years immediately pre- 
ceding the date of the proposed commencement of the pension if he (a) has 
actually lodged within Canada on at least 4,384 days within the said twenty 
years, and (b) has not within the said twenty years been absent from Canada 
for more than 731 consecutive days, but in no case shall a pensioner be 
deemed a resident of Canada for twenty years unless lodged within Canada 
some time at least twenty years prior to making application. 

An applicant shall, in the absence of evidence to rebut such presumption, be 
presumed to have resided in the province in which application for pension is 
made for the five years immediately preceding the date of the proposed com- 
mencement of pension if he is then residing in the province, and if he has 
lodged therein on at least 1,095 days in the said five years, but in no case shall 
a pensioner be presumed to be a resident of such province for five years unless 
he lodged within said province some time at least five years prior to making 
application. 

For the purpose of determining the province in which an applicant has resided, 
and subject to [the regulations preceding], if an applicant had left Canada and 
subsequently returned to Canada he shall, in the absence of evidence to rebut 
such presumption, be presumed to have continued to reside in the province 
which he left until the date of his return.48 

Although none of these regulations advise which records would constitute accept- 
able proof of residence, in fact census returns were the source of information 
consulted. 

Native People 

The welfare of native people was the responsibility of the federal government. 
Since n,atives were provided for by the Indian Act, they were excluded from 
receiving old age pensions. Applicants for the old age pension had to prove that 
they were not "Indians" as defined by this act, that is: "any male person of Indian 
blood reputed to belong to a particular band; any child of such person; [or] any 
woman who is or was lawfully married to such person."49 Unlike other eligibility 
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requirements, no documentation was required of applicants to prove that they were 
not native. Curiously, the only reference to the native qualification anywhere in the 
application is tucked away in the applicant's declaration on the last page. 
Obviously, the racial judgement of the local board was considered acceptable in 
determining status as a %on-Indian." This exclusion of native people continued 
until 1955, when Old Age Assistance was finally extended to them as well.'o 

Income and Property 

Almost half of the application was taken up by means test questions regarding 
income and property. The commission demanded particulars on all sources of per- 
sonal income and equity in property. Investments such as annuities, large bank 
accounts, and even a spouse's earnings constituted income. Before the Dominion 
Government made the programme universal in 195 1, these sources of income 
could adversely affect an applicant's eligibility for a pension. When old age pen- 
sions were first implemented in Ontario in 1929, the maximum amount allowed to 
an applicant was $240 a year. Pensioners were permitted to earn an additional 
$125, for a total of $365 annually." Those pensioners who earned more than $125 
a year had a percentage of the excess deducted from their monthly cheque.52 After 
this routine was established, the commission would only consider reinstating a 
pension to its original level if the applicant could prove his or her income had been 
reduced or had ceased altogether. Of course, there were ways in which pensioners 
could evade these restrictions, including bartering and simply not reporting certain 
income. Yet, it would be a matter of speculation as to how widespread such 
cheating might have been in the early years of the programme. 

The value of an applicant's property was also considered by the commission. 
Normally, income derived from real property (land) was calculated as a percentage 
of the assessed value. But the fear of fraud was ever present. Because real property 
might have been transferred in order to qualify for a pension, applicants were 
obliged to account for all sales or gifts of real property made for a period of five 
years preceding the a p p l i c a t i ~ n . ~ ~  If the commission found that a transfer had been 
made, it was presumed to have been done in order that the applicant would qualify. 
The application was then disqualified until the real property (or its equivalent 
value) was restored to the applicant. If the person to whom the real property was 
transferred refused to return it, the commission could defer the applicant's pension 
until such time as the withheld payments reached an amount equal to the estimated 
equity in the property.54 

Because income could be derived from real property, it was a right of the com- 
mission to demand of an applicant the legal description of his or her real property, 
its value, and any encun~brances. It was also in this section of the earliest applica- 
tions that seniors were asked the following question: "If you or your wife (or hus- 
band) owns the dwelling house in which you reside[,] are you willing to transfer 
same to the Pension Commission?" This query, which no doubt caused many 
applicants to stop and think twice, was not as odious as it might seem. It was part 
of a measure which allowed pensioners to continue to reside in their homes, but in 
such a manner that the income potential calculated from the value of their real 
property did not reduce their level of pension. 
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The commission held the pensioner's real property as collateral in order to 
reclaim the amount of pension "overpayments" after the pensioner moved or died. 
At that time the commission could sell the real property and recover the amount of 
money it had overpaid. However, the commission was prevented from recovering 
pension overpayments through the sale of real property which passed by will to 
another pensioner (namely a spouse), or to any person (including relatives) who 
assisted in supporting the pensioner for a period of three years prior to his or her 
death.55 From 1944 it was the practice of the Ontario Old Age Pensions 
Commission not to claim against an estate of $2,000 or less, or against the first 
$2,000 of an estate valued over $2,000 if there was a will and the beneficiaries 
were all domiciled in Canadas6 

Income could also be derived from chattel (or movable) property, which was cal- 
culated at a percentage of the appraised cash value. Chattel property included fur- 
niture and livestock-such as cattle, horses, sheep, poultry, and even bees. The 
income provision, respecting both real and chattel property, was eventually 
dropped in 1 947.57 

Other Considerations 

In addition to questions regarding eligibility, the application also contained sec- 
tions for the applicant's statutory declaration and other, more clerical, notations- 
such as the date the application was received, and whether the pension was granted 
or refused. Less self-explanatory are the sections requiring a list of all the 
applicant's living sons and daughters, and details of their contribution towards 
their parent's maintenance. This interest in the applicant's children stemmed from 
the revised 1927 Parents Maintenance Act of Ontario, which made adult children 
liable for the support of their aged and dependent parents." Many applicants 
claimed that their children were unable to support them, no doubt thinking that this 
would make it easier to get a pension. However, as the applications indicate, such a 
claim did not automatically relieve children of their obligation to support their 
parents.59 

In addition, a number of the applications filed in the Norfolk series are what were 
referred to as "blind pensions." In 1937 the role of the Ontario Old Age Pensions 
Commission was expanded to include pensions for the blind. With a reduced quali- 
fying age and a higher allowable income, blind allowances continued as an exten- 
sion of the old age pension programme until 1951. In that year, support for blind 
people came under the new Blind Persons Act.60 

If an applicant proved eligible, then he or she was entitled to a monthly pension. 
As noted, the initial maximum pension was $240 per year, or $20 per month. 
Pensioners were also allowed to earn $125 a year in addition to their monthly pen- 
sions, but not more than the combined sums-or $365. The rationale governing the 
amount of additional income allowed was based on the belief that pensioners could 
live on a dollar a day.h' Yet, wartime inflation resulted in two rate increases in old 
age pensions before municipal involvement ended in 1948. In 1942 Ontario sup- 
plemented its pensions by $3, so that the maximum pension rose to $23 a month. 
In July 1943 the Dominion Government increased the pension by another $5, for a 
total maximum pension of $28 per month. In 1944, the allowable income of $365 
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was increased to $425.h2 The second federal increase came in 1947, when the max- 
imum pension rose to $30 a month. The allowable yearly income was also raised to 
$600.63 

Provenance and Arrangement 

Old age pension applications were made in triplicate, with copies kept on file at the 
municipal, provincial, and federal levels. After municipal involvement ended in 
1948, the set for Norfolk County was stored in the court house in Simcoe. In 1972 
this apparently long-forgotten archival cache was discovered and acquired by 
Edward Phelps, who was then in charge of the Regional Collection within The 
D.B. Weldon Library at the University of Western Ontario. 

Upon their delivery to the Regional Collection, the applications appeared to be 
disorganized and incomplete. The numbers assigned to individual files did not fol- 
low in chronological order and spans of numbers were discovered for which no 
files existed. Initially, the gaps were thought to have resulted from rejected appli- 
cations, which were discarded without their numbers being reassigned. Given the 
mixed order of the dates, it soon became obvious that the explanation was more 
involved. In fact, the one collection comprised two series of numbered files, which 
had become combined. This inadvertent amalgamation can be traced back to the 
Hepburn Government's attempts at cost-cutting centralization during the Great 
Depression. Despite the abolition of the local boards in 1935, the original series 
begun in 1929 was continued by municipal clerks. When the local boards were re- 
established in 1937, a new series of numbers was started. At some point the new 
series was accidentally superimposed on the old, with post-1937 applications filed 
in place of missing applications from the 1929 series." 

Physically, the application is a legal-sized folio into which supplementary docu- 
ments were sometimes placed. These included declarations, change of address 
notifications, routine departmental correspondence, and, beginning in 1935, special 
reports which were filed by clerks regarding applicants' eligibility. In addition, 
most of the files include an index card prepared by the local pension board, which 
records the applicant's status as an old age p e n s i ~ n e r . ~ ~  

Freedom of Znformation/Protection of Privacy 

The Ontario Freedom of Informution and Protection of Privacy Act, originally 
passed in 1987, was intended to "provide a right of access to information under the 
control of institutions ..." and also to "protect the privacy of individuals with 
respect to personal information about themselves held by  institution^...."^^ While 
the act was obviously intended for more modern records, the Norfolk County Old 
Age Pension Applications also come under its provisions. They contain personal 
information the disclosure of which, according to the act, could constitute an 
"unjustified invasion of personal pri~acy."~'  The provision that relates most specif- 
ically to old age pension applications concerns information used to determine eligi- 
bility for social service and welfare benefikhR 
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However, "personal information does not include information about an individual 
who has been dead for more than thirty  year^."^' Arguably, the protective aspect of 
the act no longer applies to the Norfolk County Old Age Pension Applications, 
since all the successful applicants (even those who applied just prior to the end of 
municipal involvement in 1948) can be presumed to be dead. However, there is 
another consideration to take into account. Applicants who were seventy years of 
age in 1948 theoretically could have lived to see their 100th birthday in 1978. With 
the additional restriction for thirty years after death, certain files should continue to 
be classified as personal information and closed at least until the year 2008. 
Complicating matters further is the question of personal information regarding 
applicants' relatives, including spouses and children. A literal adherence to the act 
would require that this information also be restricted well into the coming century. 

Current scholarly and genealogical demands for access renders such an inflexible 
approach unrealistic. In response, the staff of the Regional Collection have adopted 
a two-pronged reference strategy for access to welfare records, including the 
Norfolk County Old Age Pension Applications. Where a particular file is request- 
ed, as in the case of a genealogical pursuit, the onus is on the staff of the Regional 
Collection to ensure that the applicant has been dead for the necessary thirty years. 
If the patron can provide reasonable proof to this effect, then information relating 
specifically to the applicant will be released. Information concerning other family 
members is similarly restricted. In the case of academic research requiring a survey 
of the entire collection, the spirit of the law is respected by having the patron sign a 
research contract agreeing not to publish or otherwise divulge any identifiable per- 
sonal information. 

While archivists can take some comfort from a provision in the act which allows 
the disclosure of "as much of the record as can reasonably be severed without dis- 
closing the information that falls under one of the [restrictive] exemptions [to free- 
dom of inf~rmation],"~" it cannot be taken to imply some sort of blanket protection 
for indulgent access provided to sensitive records. The Ontario Freedom of 
Information and Protection of Privacy Act remains vague and inadequate when 
applied to archival collections. Unless the act is clarified, access to records such as 
the Norfolk County Old Age Pension Applications will continue to be a source of 
concern, confusion, and consternation for most archivists. 

Conclusion 

Although old age pension applications were made in triplicate, none of the provin- 
cial and federal level copies appear to have survived. A similar situation exists 
concerning the municipal copies, with the exception of those for Norfolk County 
and Lambton County (which are also held by the Regional Collection). After 
municipal involvement ended in 1948, many of these records were stored wherever 
space was available--often in poor environmental conditions. Middlesex County's 
old age pension applications are a good example of the fate many municipal sets 
must have suffered. After an exhaustive search, the author could find no trace of 
them. Perhaps they were stored in the land registry office, in which case they 
would have been destroyed when the old building was demolished in 1980. Or they 
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might have been stored in the old Middlesex County court house, which still 
stands, and were simply tossed out during some post-1948 house-cleaning binge. 

However, not all old age pension applications from the municipal level have nec- 
essarily been destroyed. Sets of these records might still exist in some forgotten 
corner of a municipal building, a land registry office, or even a county garage. 
Local archivists should be aware of the potential for discovery, and the research 
value of these papers from our recent past. Hopefully, the Norfolk (and Lambton) 
County Old Age Pension Applications will not prove to be the only surviving 
records of their kind to offer us insight into the rise of Canadian social welfare in 
Ontario. 
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In January of 1936, John Henry Vannatter of Houghton Township applied for the 
old age pension. Because Vannatter died in 1953, more than 30 years ago, the 
information pertaining to him is no longer considered personal as defined under 
the Ontario Freedom of Information and Protection of Privacy Act. The informa- 
tion relating to his family is another matter, however, and could be considered 
personal. Reproduced with the permission of the family. 
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